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Editor - International Journal of Educational Methodology <editor@ijem.com> Wed, May 11, 2022 at 8:16 PM

To: Arif Abdul Hagq <mr.hagg@gmail.com>
Cc: farihinnurd@gmail.com, ibnupakar@gmail.com, hana.zyza@gmail.com, widodoiain@gmail.com

Dear Dr. Haqq,

Please see the attached galley proof of your paper (word file). We have corrected some references according to APA
7 manual. Wrong parts have been highlighted in yellow in this finalized paper. Could you edit your paper carefully
please? Please highlight in green for your edited parts.

By the way,
1- Please check the language of your paper as a proofreading lastly.

2- Please check all references regarding with attached citation guide for APA 7 style. (Please see the citation guide
page in our web site: https://www.ijem.com/citation-guide)

We ask you to check it please. Please edit at word file and resend it to me please in 24 hours. The deadline is May
12, 2022.

Best regards,

Ahmet C. Savas, Ph.D.

Editor, International Journal of Educational Methodology
editor@ijem.com

www.ijem.com

On 5/11/2022 7:24 AM, Arif Abdul Haqq wrote:
Dear Editor
Here we attachthe copyright transfer agreement of our manuscript.

Entitled: "A Skill Application Model to Improve Teacher Competence and Professionalism".
ID Manuscript: ID#22031407404285

List of corresponding author name:
1. Farihin, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia, 0000-
0003-2993-9444, farihinnur4@gmail.com

2. Suteja, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia, 0000-
0002-4682-3411, ibnupakar@gmail.com

3. Muslihudin, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia, 0000-
0001-5694-0630, hana.zyza@gmail.com

4. Aris, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia, 0000-0002-
3956-9902, arissuherman60@gmail.com

5. Arif Abdul Haqq*, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia,
0000-0003-0478-1177, mr.hagg@gmail.com

6. Widodo Winarso, Institut Agama Islam Negeri Syekh Nurjati Cirebon, Indonesia,
0000-0002-8527-7660, widodoiain@gmail.com

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=3680a3b574&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1732535975958704821&simpl=msg-f%3A173253...  1/2


https://www.ijem.com/citation-guide
mailto:editor@ijem.com
http://www.ijem.com/
mailto:farihinnur4@gmail.com
mailto:ibnupakar@gmail.com
mailto:hana.zyza@gmail.com
mailto:arissuherman60@gmail.com
mailto:mr.haqq@gmail.com
mailto:widodoiain@gmail.com

8/3/22, 10:00 AM Gmail - Galley proof of your paper IJEM ID#22031407404285

On Tue, May 10, 2022 at 6:51 PM International Journal of Educational Methodology
<editor@ijem.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Arif Abdul Haqq,

We have received your payment about your paper entitled "A Skill Application Model to Improve
Teacher Competence and Professionalism" ID#22031407404285. Thank you for your payment.

We kindly ask from you to sign the copyright transfer agreement for your paper. After all author(s)
signed, please scan and send via email to me as soon as possible. Please download the pdf file of
this agreement from this link : https://ijjem.com/I[JEM-copyright-transfer-agreement.pdf

You can use e-signature, if you have. Also you can use your mobil phone as a scanner. If the other
author live in another city, he/she sign the paper and send this paper via email individually. Than you
can send all of the papers in one email. We are preparing the galley proof of your paper. We will send
it to you in order to check before publication.

We are looking forward to getting copyright transfer agreement .
Best regards,

Ahmet Savas, Ph.D.

Editor, International Journal of Educational Methodology
editor@ijem.com

www.ijem.com
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Arif Abdul Haqq <mr.hagg@gmail.com> Thu, May 12, 2022 at 3:17 AM
To: Editor - International Journal of Educational Methodology <editor@ijem.com>

Dear Editor,
We have edited the incorrectly highlighted (yellow) in green color as directed in this final paper. Please see the fixed
galley; We attached it to this email. We have also reread this galley paper, and it is by the language. Also, with all

references, we have already checked.

Thank you.
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